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BID System Key Concepts hydrgne

* INQUIRIES: All RFx specific inquiries only go to the buyer identified in
the RFx.

* Bidders can retrieve all RFx types from the BID System.

* To maintain a copy of the RFx (Bid Invitation) for your records, see
Instructions on slide 15. You must do this PRIOR to creating a bid.

* See slide 47 to understand important implications of holding,
submitting, changing, changing & holding and resubmitting bids.
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Log in to the BID System one

Bidder enters User ID and Password provided by Hydro One

hydro@

Regizter here

User I
Passwiord - I
Change Password Password Forgotten
Hydro One Metworks Inc. Bidding System Log On Soeen T:":mu]qg
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Changing Your Password

Change Password

* First time entry will prompt the

% Mo switeh to HTTPS oczurred, so it is not secure to

user to change the password el b UL
[ Thiz i= an initial pazsword that must be charged
* Enter the current Password
supplied to you by Hydro One :u lsaEsunm |
Current password *
 Choose and enter your new | Now password * ]
Password and repeat your new | Repest Passwora® | '
Password in the field provided

« Select Change to complete the
transaction

Password requirements:
At least two characters must be different in the new password
There must be at least one numeric (0-9)
There must be at least one letter (A-Z)

The password must be at least eight characters long (XXXXXXXX)
There must be at least one lower case (a-z) and one upper case (A-Z) character

© 2011 Hydro One All rights reserved. Proprietary and confidential.
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BID System Navigation

* When using the BID System, DO NOT use the Internet Explorer
browser navigation buttons

* |If these buttons are used, the BID System will not function properly

.
It is iImportant to only use the navigation methods
within the BID System

© 2011 Hydro One All rights reserved. Proprietary and confidential.
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BID System — Search Criteria

Home Help Log off
Hydro One o i il Search
[] Process Bids Criteria
[Frocess Bid |  Find Bid Invitations and Auction ="
Gt R Mumber of Document Name Status Procezsed by Me
| . Current Bid Invitations j I j
Extended Search
Tip: Choose a symbel in the navigation column or navigate to the bid overview by choosing the bid number
Search Result: 8 Hits
Number HName Trans. Type End Date Bid Status
7000000423 AS_service test 2011.04.06 16:03:54 RFQ 2011.04.13 00:00:00| No Bid Created
7000000422 Tendering Text/ MPN Te204/08/2011 10:12 RFQ 2011.04.13 00:00:00 No Bid Created
7000000407 MPN & SHIP TO ADDRESS RFQ 2011.04.28 00:00:00 No Bid Created
7000000408 P GROUP DISPLAY FROW EXT. REQ RFQ 2011.04.20 00:00:00 No Bid Created
7000000402 AS_Test PGroup 0440542011 00:02 RFQ 2011.04.16 00:00:00| No Bid Created
7000000340 WF RFQ 2011.03.22 11:15:00 Bid submitted
7000000237 Aftachments test RFQ 2011.03.03 16:20:00 | Bid submitted
7000000233 bidder role test 3 RFQ 2011.02.03 10:40:00 Release Rejected
7000000227 | role test bidder RFQ 2011.03.02 14:38:00 Bid submitted

hyd

ro@

LLLLL LS

one

number, name, status or processed by date

A dropdown list of all the Bid Invitations (Public/ Recipient directed)
based on the search criteria selected, either by the document

© 2011 Hydro One All rights reserved. Proprietary and confidential.



- e R
hyd "8&;

BID System — Search Criteria

 The Process Bids Screen displays a Search Engine

 The Bidder can enter the BID Number if known or Search for a bid by
entering the Search Criteria in the Filters provided

Hydro One Home Hep | Loaof | hydro™
one
+ Process Bids
Find Bid Invitations and Auctions
Process Bidder and Contact Perzon iiiher o1 DomEnet e , Priicessed iy He

| o | |CurrentEIid Invitations j | j

End Date

Product Category All Bids from My Company

additional

click to display
status options

Enter the Bid Invitation Enter the Bid Name in
Number (if known) in the the name field
Number of Document field (if known)

© 2011 Hydro One All rights reserved. Proprietary and confidential.
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BID System — Search Criteria

A bidder can perform a Simple Search or an EXELdEd SEereh to display
additional search criteria

Hydro One Home tiel Logoff . hydm@
- one
¢ Process Bids
Find Bid Invitations and Auctions
I EEE———-— L L) Number of Document Name i Processed by Me
| = | Current Bid Invitationz j | j
Product Category End Date All Bidz from My Company
|_;| [ click to display
additional

status options

i

A description of the fields is given on the next slide

© 2011 Hydro One All rights reserved. Proprietary and confidential.
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Search Criteria — Description of Fields

Field Name Description

Number of Bid Invitation Number — 10 digit unique number starting with number range 7XXXXXXXXX
Document

Name Name of the Bid Invitation

Status  Status of the Bid Invitation used to identify the completion status of an event.

Entering a status will narrow the search result
* Held Bids — Work in process bids that are created and saved but NOT submitted.

* The Bids are NOT checked by the system for completeness/correctness or finalized
by the user to be completed at a later date

« Current Bid Invitations — Open Bid Invitations

« Ended Bid Invitations — Submission date and time has reached; however the Bid
Invitation has Not yet been marked “closed” by the Buyer

* Completed Bid Invitations — Bid Invitations that are manually closed in the system by
the Buyer

* Blank Selection displays all Bid Invitations (Public/Recipient directed)

© 2011 Hydro One All rights reserved. Proprietary and confidential.
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Search Criteria — Description of Fields

Field Name Description
Processed by Me Allows to filter Bids to display for time periods by user
End Date Bid submission end date
Product Category Product Category is not being used at this time
End of Binding Bid Validity Period
Period
All Bids From My Displays a list of all the Bid Status from the Bidder:
Company « No Bid Created
* Held

* Bid Submitted

10
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BID System — Search Criteria
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Once all the search criteria in the drop down menu has been entered,

click |Start

Hydro One

Procezs Bid
Process Vendor or Bidder

to display the results of the search

o
Home Help Settings Log off hydro(-‘,
one

Process Bids

Find Bid Invitations and Auctions

Number of Document Name Status Processed by Me

; o : ijl:urrent Bid Invitations ___ i -i

Extended Search

Tip: Choose a symbol in the navigation column or navigate to the bid overview by cheosing the bid number

Humber Name Trans. Type End Date Bid Status Action

7000001068 E0SS07 2011.05.19 13:58:56 RFQ 2011.05.20 15:00:00 No Bid Created b i
7000001067 email cp test RFQ 2011.05.22 00:00:00 | No Bid Created , @ (ol
7000001068 AS_Test 2011.05.19 11:11:18 RFQ 2011.05.31 00:00:00 Ne Bid Created o, Ji (o]
7000001055 AS_Email Test 2011.05.19 08:41:07 RFQ 2011.05.31 00:00:00 No Bid Created -, ]
7000001054 Henry Test email 2011.05.18 17:19:48 RFQ 2011.05.31 00:00:00 No Bid Created o, 7 m
7000001052 E0S525 2011.05.18 11:37:54 RFQ 2011.05.31 00:00:00 | No Bid Created |

FF

11
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BID System — Sign up Process one

* Itis mandatory for bidders to complete the Sign Up process for each
public bid invitation to be able to participate in the bidding process

« Bidders who receive directed RFx are already Signed Up.
e Click on the Bid Invitation number that you wish to participate in

Tip: Choo=se a 2ymbol in the navigation column or navigates to the bid overview by choo=ing the bid number
Search Result: 25 Hits

Humber Name Trans. Type End Date Bid Status Action
7000001088 E0SE07 2011.05.19 13:58:56 RFQ 2011.05.20 15:00:00 | No Bid Created Y AU
7000001067 email cp test RFQ 2011.05.22 00:00:00 No Bid Created b, 4 T
7000001086 AS_Test 2011.05.19 11:11:18 RFQ 2011.05.31 00:00:00 | No Bid Created b, A T
7000001055 AS_Email Test 2011.05.19 08:41; 2011.05.31 00:00:00 No Bid Created b, AP @
7000001054 Henry Test email 2011.05.18 17: Opens Document 2011.05.31 00:00:00 | No Bid Created L W

7000001052 WOS52S 1 : 2011.05.31 00:00:00 Mo Bid Created & g[
in Display Mode R
7000001051 | AS_ Test Email 2011.05.18 10:53 2011.05.31 00:00:00 Mo Bid Created 5 A |

12
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Sign up for the selected Bid by clicking on the | sign Up

Hydro One Home Help Settings Log off

1+ Display RFI
Procesz Bid I Create i i_’*:-: | i Change : [Refrest ||Dut|:|ut Preview

Procezs Wendor or Bidder

RFl: Hame E0557% 2011.05 058

Please note that the
General Data Create button is

button

Bazic Data disabled until the

Check the information forthe bid [ SIgN Up process is
complete
Time Zone EST
End Date 2011.05.31 00:00:00
Opening Date 2011.05.31 §0:00:00

End of Binding Pericd 2011.05.31
Currency CAD Canadian Dollar

13

© 2011 Hydro One All rights reserved. Proprietary and confidential.



7,
N hydroF
Signing Up one

* Once you have signed up, the system will confirm that you have been
Registered and any changes to the bid invitation going forward will be
communicated to the signed up bidders via email for all RFx.

» Select ok. A message will appear in the Display RFQ Screen
Display RFQ
|3 ign Up | | Create| | Change | | Refrezh | | CQutput Preview |

RFQ: Name AS_Test2011.05.1%11:11:16 Number 7000001068

_ e

Basic Data || Information from Purchaser | Partner/Delivery Address

Check the information for the bid invitation.

Time Zone EST
End Date 2011.05.3
Opening Date 2011.05.31

L ] ‘j Bid irvite sign-up camplete, wau will be infarmed of amy changes via email
End of Binding Period 2011.08.30 -

Currency CAD Cana

1 Mez=zage

o] Bid invite sign-up complets,you will be informed of any changss via email

14
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Maintain a record of the Bid Invitation

Print or save a copy of the Bid Invitation for your records by clicking on
the Output Preview button and print or save PRIOR to creating a Bid.

Home Help Settings Log off
ydro One

1« Display RFI
Process Bid | Sign Up | | Create || Hold | | Change | | Refresh il Output Preview |

Process Wendor or Bidder

RFl: Name E05675 2011.05.05 14:05:33 Number 7000001045

il G-l 0a

Bazic Data

Check the information for the bid invitation.

Time Zone EST
End Date 2011.05.31 00:00:00
Opening Date 2011.05.31 00:00:00

End of Binding Period 2011.05.21

currency CAD Canadian Dollar

15
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Output Preview

A PDF file will open in a separate window. Please note: This is your
ONLY opportunlty to save or prlnt a copy of the Bid Invitation

Hydfo One Home Seftings Log off hydro@
4 Dlsplay RFI
Proceszs Bid Sign Up | | \ | Change I | Refresh \ |0utput Preview Back to Initial Screen

Process Vendor or Bidder

RFl: Name E0S675 2011.05.05 14:05:32 Humber 7000001045

|Basic Data

Check the information for the bid invitation

Time Zone EST

End Date

To Print

Bid invitation
RFI

To save

Date: 2011.05.05 18:06:29

Re: E05679 2011.05.05 14:05:33 Number 7000001045

Bid invitation rules

Bid invitation currency: CAD

Requested price information: Prices are not relevant in this bid invitation.
Timezone: EST

Submission deadline: 2011.05.31 00:00:00

Opening date: 2011.05.31 00:00:00

Your bid is valid until:  2011.05.31

16
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Before Entering a Bid Y 3ne

You MUST save a copy or print a copy of the RFx PRIOR to selecting
create

Change | | Refresh | | Output Preview Back to Initial Screen

RFGQ: Name AS_Email Test 2011.05.1% 08:41:07 Number 7000001055

_ e e

Bazic Data || Infermation from Purchaser | Partner/Delivery Address

Check the information for the bid invitation.

Time Zone EST
End Date 2011.05.31 00:00:00
Opening Date 2011.05.31 00:00:00

End of Binding Period 2011.07.31

Currency CAD Canadian Dollar

1 Megzage

o] Bid inwite =ign-up complete,you wil be informed of any changes via email

17
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Use Data Tabs to review the RFx

Process Bid
° |nf0rmat|0n on the DISplay RFX [Submit| [Hold | | Delete | [ check] [ Refresh | [ output Preview
and Process Bid Screens is
Organlzed on 2 Ievels RFQ: Hame AS_Test Email 2011.05.18 10:58:34 Number 7000001051

— General Data: Information Il == 0aia LT

Bazic Data || Infermation from Purchazer | My Notes | Partner/Delivery Address

Dlsplayed In thIS SeCtion Check the information in ywour bid. “ou can aleo add your own notes.
apply to the entire Bid |
Invitation S
— ltem Data: Informa“on End Date 2011.05.31 00:00:00
dlSpIayed In thIS SeCtion :p:ni:;l];te | 2011.05.31 00:00:00
. . e . nd of Binding Period 2011.058.25%
applies to the specific item
Ievel CIICk On the Informat|0n Incoterm / Location | ||ﬂ|
from Purchaser to view all erms of Payment
the communication including  curensy CAD Canadan Dolar
Tenderlng TeXt and an Created on 2011.05.20 09:29:52 by Ms. Jans Doe
attaChmentS '[O the Bld Last processed on  2011.05.20 09:29:52 by Ms. Jane Doe

Invitation

1 Mez=zage

o Bid invite sign-up complete,vou will be informed of any changes via email

18
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Entering a Bid hydr8ne

 Only RFQs are submitted in the BID System.

* All other RFx (RFP, RFPQ, RFI, RFT) will be submitted as directed in
the individual RFx.

19
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Entering a Bid
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» Select “Create” if you intend to respond to the Bid Invitation

 Clicking on the |cCreate| button, displays the Basic Data within the General
Data Tab

Display RFQ
Sign Up | | Createl | Haold | | Change | | Refresh | | Qutput Preview Back to Initial Screen

RFQ: Hame AS_Email Test 2011.05.15 08:41:07 HNumber 7000001055

_

Bazic Data|| Information from Purchazer

Check the information for the bid invitation.

Partner/Delivel

Time Zone EST
End Date 2011.05.31 00:00:00
Opening Date 2011.05.31 00:00:00

End of Binding Period 2011.07.31

Currency CAD Canadian Dollar

1 Mes=age

f Addressz

o Bid invite gign-up complete,you will be informed of any changes via email

© 2011 Hydro One All rights reserved. Proprietary and confidential.
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General Data

The information on the General Data tab is relevant to the
entire bid invitation in regards to:

— Basic Data

— Information From Purchaser
— My Notes

— Partner/Delivery Address

_

Bazic Data|| Infermation from Purchaser | My Notes | Partner/Delivery Address

Check the information in vour bid. You can alzo add vour own notes.

21
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ltem Data

 The information on the Item Data tab is relevant to each
Item

« Select the item by clicking on the item number to access
the Item Data information

Process Bid
| Su t:-mit| | Hold | | Delete| | Check| | Refresh | | CQutput Preview | Back te Initial Screen

RFQ: Name AS_ Test Email 2011.05.18 10:58:34 Number 7000001051

Tip: (1) ou can enter values directly in the tables and press Submit button on the top, or you can go te the detailz of each tem by clicking the tem number or detail icon and then submit your bid.
(2} "ou cannot submit bids dirgctly on tems with conditional pricing, or tems with reguired attributes.

|:| Dizplay Documents

Item Overview
F_Find Item

L Submitted . Delivery . Attachmentz  Notez
lkem De=cription ltem Category Product Category Quantity Price AROQ. Days Required (buryextms) |{buyerine)|
KR-GASKET FOR CIRCUIT BREAKER Material Breaker parts 100.000 each caD per |1 On 2011.06.28 oo L] i

Legend :Q Dizplay item detailz @ Change
1 Meszage

o Bid invite sign-up complets, you will be informed of any changes via email

22
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ltem Data

The information on the Item Data tab is organized like the
iInformation on the General Data tab, but is only relevant to
the selected item in regards to:

— Basic Data

— Information From Purchaser
— My Notes

— Partner/Delivery Address

General Data =k

Bazic Data|| Information from Purchazer | My Notes | Partner/Delivery Address

Item Detail 1: AIRICH-SEAT-230KV AIRBLAST BREAKER

23
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Entering a Bid — General Data

Complete the following fields at the header level:

Incoterm/ R The INCO Term (International Commercial
Location |Required | Terms) designation and the Location pertaining
to the INCO Term. Data entered at the header
level applies to all individual items in the bid. If
the INCO Term is different for an individual

item, that term should be entered at the item
level

Currency C If the RFx allows different currencies to be
Conditional | used, select the currency for your bid

24
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Incoterm

If you click on the Incoterm # button, you will be taken to a screen
where you can choose the appropriate three-letter trade term

e e

Bazic Data|| Information from Purchazer | My Notes | Parner/Delivery Address

Check the information in yvour bid. You can also add your own notes

Search Result Find Incoterms: 13 Entries
Bid Mumber 2000000763

Incoterm . Incoterm Name

Time Zone EST CFR Cost and Freight
End Date 2011.05.31 00:00:00 CIF Cest, Inzurance and Freight
Opening Date 2011.05.31 00:00:00 CIp Carriage and Inzurance Paid To
End of Binding Perind 2011.06.30 CPT Carriage Paid To
Bid Status OAF Delivered at Frontier
Incoterm / Location | LDF DE'??EFE:I Duty Faid :

ooy Delivered Duty Unpaid
Terms of Payment DEQ Delivered Ex Quay (Duty Paid)
Currency CAD Canadian Dollar DEZS Delivered Ex Ship
Created on 2011.05.20 13:18:12 by Ms.. EXW Ex Works
Last processed on 20110520 131812 by Ms.. o5 Free Alengside Ship

FCA Free Carrier

FOB Free On Beard

25
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Entering a Bid — Information from hydro(?
Purchaser one

Selecting the “Information from Purchaser” tab will display the Invitation
and / or Addenda and documents Hydro One posts to the RFx pertaining
to all items in that Bid Invitation if under General Data tab or to the
specific Item of under the Item tab

e L

Basic Data || Infermation from Purchaser|| My Notes | Partner/Delivery Address

Check the information in your bid.
Texts

To Dizplay / Edit the Texts, Choose the Appropriate Text Type

Text Overview

caiTvpe el Previcw (80 Chars )
mg text IISuI::ject: Invitation Letter Re: Request for Tender: RFT ... I
Purchaser's Remarks DSROIDUYFYTYFIOU

Tendering text

Subject: Invitation Letter
e Request for Tender: RFT Number 70000000450

scription:

his Request for Tender ("RFI”) is being issued by Inergi LF on behe
wdro One xxxxxxxxxxx Inc. Notwithstanding any document toc the cont
wdro Cne xxxxxxxxxxx Inc. is the sole purchaser with respect to thi
d any subsequent award; and the eguipment and/or material(s) beinc
urchased will be used by Hydro One xxxxxxxxxxx Inc. or its affiliat

our tender submission, Part 4, is due in possession of the Purchase
later than the time, date and at the address referenced in the attac™

< > A Texk
Category Version Processor Tvp File Size (Kb} Changed By Changed on
Standard Attachment 1 doc oty E0S378 19.01.2011 08:18:50

26
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Entering a Bid — My Notes one

« Bidder can enter any T I
notes/remarks for the buyer Iin ——
the Bidder's Remarks section as
well as attach any documents to
the Bid
e Click on My Notes | from the < )
General Data tab to enter
comments in the Bidder's Ay

[Descnptiun Technical Specifications

Remarks SeCtion regardlng the Path jﬂFﬂﬁmiluW\EUE&?BS\SynchFuId1
entire bid or the Item Data tab to [ T

enter comments regarding a e
Description Caleqory Version Processor  Typ  Fie Size (Kb) Changed By Changed on
par“CUIar |tem 40 TechncalDrawings N\ Standard Atachment 1 foc 1215 E0001 0402201 131244
t Descrin 3 (Click on the file name o open attachment

27
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Information From Purchaser — item level

e Click on Infermation from Purchaser tg view all the communication including
Tendering Text and any attachments to the Bid Invitation

» Select the Tendering Text button to display the Tendering Text

Home Help Log off ’J"’
Hydro One : hydrn(a
» [Regster] [feis] [Change] [Refresn] one

RFQ: Name AS-Test-tem Long Text- 2011.02.04 13:37 Number 7000000801

-

Basic Data | Information from Purchaser|| Partner/Delivery Address ¢ Back Continue » Back to tem Overview

Item Detail 1: "0" RINGS, RING, ABB AS13506P26-Jan31-1

Texts

- ! T a B
Tendering text Item Text:

This is PReqg Text

Material Purchase Order Text:

Thiis is Purchase Order text

Material 10000160

Material Basic Text:

™0™ RINGS, RING, RBB R913506F26

This is basic data text material 100001&0
added to teat SR-UTS2

Manufacture Part Number:

i
< | >
De=zcription Category Wersion Processor Typ File Size (Kb} Changed By Changed on
Technical Specifications Standard Attachment 1 doc 20 E0S378 04.02.2011 12:45:54 28
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My Notes - Uploading Attachments

Item Detail 1: 0" RNGS, RING, ABB AS13506P26-Jan31-1 ® C I i C k O n to I O Cate th e

Texts

Sits o ' document on your computer.

* Provide the document name in
the Description section.

e Click |Add|to attach the
document to the Bid Invitation.

( ) e Click |editDezcrigticn to edit the
Attachments descnpUOn

* To delete the attachment select

Dezcription Technical Specifications

i g ONELSETSSSyetFod 1 the attaChment and l| Delete

— - » The attachment will be listed
0 Im |Fﬂm g m%% VETW - j‘iﬂ %@t %:‘:—BY newﬁ%m under the uoverVIeW Of
4 9 (Click on the file name to open aftachment AttaCh me ntS” SeCtI O n .

29
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Entering a Bid — Item Data

 Clicking on ' tembata | displays all the line items for the Bid Invitation

» Checking off the Display Documents check box lists any attachments
from the buyer to the individual line items. Clicking on the @ button
displays the Information from Purchaser Tab for the specific line item

» Process Bid
| Submitl | Hold | | Deletel | Checkl | Refresh | | Output Preview | Back to Initial Screen

RFQ: Hame A5 attachment 2011.02.02 14:24:37 Number 7000000585

General

Tip: (1) % ou can enter values directly in the tables and press Submit butten on the top, or vou can go to the detailz of each item by clicking the item number or detail icon and then =ubmit vour bid.
(2} “ou cannot submit bids directly on items with conditional pricing, or items with required attributes.

attachments for some line
items on the Bid Invitation

Indicates that there are }

b _Find ltem

ftem Description tem Category Product Category %Jf;:_lrg;d ﬁgisg;ﬁgt}s (bljl:etﬁ'srre} Price Required

"0 RINGS, RING, ABB AG333800F23 Material Breakerpartz  |1.000 each 100 1i0]  |capeer
2 "0" RINGS, RING, ABB AG333800P4 | Material Breakerparts  |2.000 cach 110 o[ Jcapeer
3 "0" RINGS, RING, ABE AG333800P23 Material Breaker parts  ||3.000 sach 0/ 0 o[ ]

|—=

On 28.02.201

o8]

On 28.02.201

cAD Per On 28.02.201

© 2011 Hydro One All rights reserved. Proprietary and confidential.
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Entering a Bid — Item Data

Click on the Line item Number or the Details Icon to display the Item
details required to submit the bid

Hydro One Home Help Log off o | h.,,dm@
— — - one
» Process Bid
| 5ubm'rt| | Hold | | Deletel | Chﬁl:kl | Refresh | | Upload | | Output Preview I Back to Initial Screen

RFQ: Name AS_TPD_E05378 2011.01.24 10:32:55 Number 7000000459

Tip: (1) ¥ou can enter values directly in the tables and pregs Submit button on the top, or you can go to the detaile of each item by clicking the item number or detail icon and then submit your bid.
{2} ¥ou cannot =ubmit bids directly on tems with conditional pricing, or item= with required attributes.

|:| Dizplay Documents

F Find Item
e Submitted Attachments. Notes ; : :
ltem Description tem Category Product Category Quantity (buyerime) (buyerime) Price Required  Action
ARGER, 120VDC 604 208VAC,3PH, NDOOR Material  Batteries [11.000 leaen| o ro] ‘ot o |cap per [1 | On23.02.2011
AKKR-BATTERY CHARGER MOD. 5732C3 Material Batteries 21.000 ]Eﬂch 0 frp DIOD [ '| CAD Per 1 |Dn 23.02 201 1k
Add tems
Legend : Q Display item details @ Change price
Tab Page
31
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Filling in the Item Data Fields

* Some field are required to be filled out in order to submit a bid for an
RFQ

* The available fields are explained in the tables to follow

Use Description
R Field must be completed in order to proceed with the bid
Required
C A data element requirement designator, which indicates
Conditional that the presence of a specified data element is
dependent on the value or presence of other data
elements in the segment

32
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Entering a Bid — Item Data Fields

Field Name Use Description
Vendor Product Conditional Description of the Vendor Product Number.
Number Ex. GXD1547

Submitted Quantity | Conditional Default is the Quantity requesting in the RFx. This
should only be changed if the Bidder is proposing a
different quantity

Delivery Time Required Lead-time of item or service after receipt of purchase
(ARO) Days order to delivery date — in calendar days

Ex. 15
Incoterm/Location Conditional Enter only if differs from the information entered in the

Header for changes per item
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Entering a Bid — Item Data Fields

Additionally, the following fields may contain information to assist the
Bidder in preparing a Bid or contain information related to the Bid

Invitation
Field Value
Product Category Describes the category of the product
Qty of Bid Invitation The Quantity required for the RFx, subject to
the terms of the Rfx.

34
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Line Item Pricing
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* Enter the Pricing information for each
line item that you are bidding on

* Only enter prices for the line items that
are being bid on

* Please note, SAP prepopulates a
guantity for each item in the Bid. If you
do not want to bid on an item, the
guantity must be removed, otherwise
you will receive an error message when
trying to Submit.

 The bid can not be considered for items
that do not have a price entered

Check that all the relevant data
has been entered by hitting the
“Check” button

+ Process Bid

|5ubm'rt||HuIcI||Delete| RefreshHOutputF‘review

RFC: Hame E055132011.01.31 12:01:45 Number 7000000555

Basic Data | Information from Purchaser | My Notes | PartnernDelivery Address

ltem Detail 1: BR-KS0-0i-48K0-800A-1000MV A

tem Category

Material

Er

I Wendor Product Number
uct Lategory

Breaker - Qil Filled

Quantity of Bid Invitation 1.000 each
Submitted Cuantity 1.000 each
Canadian Dollar Iﬁer 1 each !1
tem Value 0.00 CAD )
pel'r'.rer'_.r Time (Duration} Days |
;{equired at 00:00:00

IEcuterm

s |
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Warning Message Reminder
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+ Process Bid
|5ubmit| | Hold | | Delete| | Checkl | Refrezh | | Upload | | Qutput Preview

RFQ: Name AS_TPD_E0S378 2011.01.24 10:32:55 Humber 7000000459

General Data iyl

Basic Data || Information from Purchaser | My Motes | Patner/Delivery Addrezss

Item Detail 22 BKR-BATTERY CHARGER MOD. 5732C3

ltem Category Material

Wendor Product Number

Product Category Batteries
Quantity of Bid Invitation 21.000 each

Submitted Quantity

Delivery Time (Duration) | | Days
Required 22.02.2011 at 23:00:00

Incoterm | | i | |

Windows Internet Explorer E

Example: If no price entered for
a line item, system will issue a
warning message. It is NOT
mandatory to bid for all line
items on the Bid Invitation.

Upon clicking the check button if
the bid is correct and complete
a window populates with the Bid
# validating the bid is complete
and without errors

"_'q Bid A5_E0S378 2011.01.20 10:01:1& is complete and contains no errors
-
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Submit the Bid
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When the Bid is ready for submission:

 Click on the | Submit

button to submit the bid. Once the bid is submitted a

window will pop up confirming the submission. Select ok.
The Bid Status will display as “Bid Submitted” in the Process Bid

transaction
« Do not use Submit to Hold Bids.

Windows Internet Explorer, E|

' E Bid A45_E0S378 2011,01,20 10:01:18 submitted
e

Hyd ro One Home Hel Log off ";‘
hyd o
4 Process Bids
Process Bid Find Bid Invitations and Auctions
Process Bidder and Contact Person Number of Document Name Statue = Process ed by Me
I = I I Current Bid Invitations LI
Product Category End Date All Bidz from My Company
[ =] | | T
Simple Search
Tip: Choo=se a symbol in the navigation column or navigate te the bid overview by choosing the bid number
Number Name Trans. Type End Date Bid'Status o Action
7000000407 | MPN & SHIP TO ADDRESS 2011.04.28 00:00:00 [Bid submitted & A7 [
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Print Bid hydr8ne

Click on the Output Preview to print or share a PDF copy of the bid
You can print a bid submission at any time, including after the End Date

Hydro One Home Help Log off
1+ Process Bid

Process Bid [Dekete | [check] [Refresh| [ Output Preview —— click to print a copy

Process Bidder and Contact Per=on of the bid

RFG: Hame P GROUP DISPLAY FROM EXT. REQ Humber 7000000408

I

Bazic Data || Information from Purchaser | My Notes | Parner/Delivery Address

Check the information in your bid. %ou can alzo add your own notes.

Bid Number 2000000155

Time Zone EST

End Date 2011.04.20 00:00:00
Opening Date 2011.04.20 00:00:00

End of Binding Period 2011.06.30

Bid Status Bid =ubmitied
Incoterm / Location I iith I
Term= of Payment | vl 38
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Print Bid

(‘ https://devhlvp.hydroone.com/sap{cz1 TSUQIMZFBETk90ITNhZGRMWh 1MTIIRFNSXZAw I THRMUY!

) ISEI.I% - il ] i [Fnd -

Click to
save a

copy

Click to
print a
copy

Company Bid
gates enterprises
TOTONTO ON MSY 3A9

CANADA Information
Hydro One Description: P GROUP DISPLAY FROM EXT. REQ

Bid Invitation Mumber: FOH00000406
Bid Mumber: 8000000155
Ship fto Address:

Hydro One Metworks

Canada

39

© 2011 Hydro One All rights reserved. Proprietary and confidential.



7,
| hydroZ
Change Bid one

 The Bidder can make changes to the Bid prior to the bid End Date

* From the Process Bid application find the appropriate Bid Invitation
and click on the pencil # icon to directly enter into the Change Mode
and make required changes to the Bid.

Process Bids

Find Bid Invitation=s and Auctions

Humber of Document Hame Status Proceszed by Me Click on the
5 Current Bid Invitatons v v pencils to
open the bid

Start| Extended Search

Tip: Chooze a gymbol in the navigation coelumn or navigate to the bid overview by choosing the bid number
Search Result: 25 Hits

Humber Name Trans. Type End Date Bid Status Action
7000001068 Sample Mams Change RFQ 2011.05.20 15:00:00|No Bid Created % m
7000001087 email cp test RFQ 2011.05.22 00:00:00 No Bid Created X m
7000001066 AS_Test 2011.05.18% 11:11:16 RFO 2011.05.31 00:00:00 | Bid =ubmitted
7000001055 AS_Email Test 2011.05.19 08:41:07 RFQ 2011.05.31 00:00:00 No Bid Created b, /i il

4y
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Change Bid Implications

e If a bidder clicks to make a change to a bid, and it’s put on HOLD, you
have effectively withdrawn the previous bid.

* Be mindful that if you do not revisit a HELD bid, and the Bid Invitation
closes, you have not submitted.
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Bidder can also click on the bid number itself to enter into the display
mode and then click on the change button to make required changes to
the Bid

Process Bids
Find Bid Invitations and Auctions
Mumber of Document Hame Statuz Proceszed by Me

ot Current Bid Invitationz A "

Start| Extended Search

Click on the

Tip: Chooze a 2ymbol in the navigation celumn or navi bid number to §heosing the bid number
Search Result: 25 Hits open the bid
Mumber Tranzs. Type End Date Bid Status Action
To00001068 | Sample Na RFCQ 2011.05.20 15:00:00 No Bid Created 5, i g[
TOO0001067 | emzde RFQ 2011.05.22 00:00:00 No Bid Created ., i m
7000001066 W5 _Test 2011.05.18 11:11:18 RFQ 2011.05.31 00:00:00 Bid =ubmitted Qﬁ‘? m
7000001055 | AS_Email Test 2011.05.15 08:41:07 RFQ 2011.05.31 00:00:00 No Bid Created ., i m
42
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Bidder can also click on the magnifying glass “ icon to enter into the
display mode and then click on the change button to make required
changes to the Bid

Process Bids

Find Bid Invitations and Auctions

Mumber of Document Hame Statuz Proceszed by Me
o Current Bid Invitationz W W
Start| Extended Search i
Click on the
Tip: Ch kolin th igati | igate to the bid iew by choozing the bid b magnifying
= L g =Y e W ¥ e e VEMIEW DV Z e =
ip: Chooze a =ymebol in the navigation column or navigate to id overvi ¥ choozing id number glass to open
Search Result: 25 Hits the bid
Mumber Name Trans. Type Action
7000001068 Sample Mames Change RFQ 2011.05.20 15:00:00 Mo Gid ™ 5, i g[
7000001067 email cp test RFQ 2011.05.22 00:00:00 Mo Bid Created m
7000001088 AS_Test 2011.05.15 11:11:18 RFQ 2011.05.31 00:00:00 Bid 2ubmitted 7 m
7000001055 AS_Email Test 2011.05.19 08:41:07 RFQ 2011.05.31 00:00:00 Mo Bid Created ., i m
43
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Display Bid
Once in the change mode, it is :ﬁ||che.:kn:ﬁ-.-ﬁ.~||Dut.,utprm
possible to make changes to Bids
as required fo”owing the procedure RFQ: Hame AS_ 11.05.19 11:11:16  Number 7000001085
outlined in Creating Bids. Rl enrai0ata LT T

Bazic Data tez | Partnern/Delivery Address

Check the information in vour bid.

Bid Number 2000000768 Click on the
Tine Zone - Change button to
make changes to
c -0 .
End Date 2011.05.31 00:00:0) the bid
Opening Date 2011.05.31 00:00:00

End of Binding Period 2011.08.30

Bid Status Bid =ubmitted

Incoterm / Location DOOP  toronto

Termz of Payment 10 Days 2.5 %, 30 Days Net

Currency CAD Canadian Dollar

Created on 2011.0520 131812 by MW=. Jane Doe
Last procez=zed on 2011.05.20 13:1812 by M=. Jane Doe
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The bidder can delete the Bid anytime before it is submitted. The bid
status should not have the status Bid Submitted, in which case the trash
can icon @ will not be available. Deletion can be done by clicking the
trash can W on the appropriate line from the Process Bid transaction

Process Bids

Find Bid Invitations and Auctions

Click on the trash
can to delete the
bid

Mumber of Document MName Status Procezzed by Me

o Current Bid Invitationz b4 w

Start Extended Search

Tip: Choose a symbol in the navigation column or navigate to the bid overview by choosing the bid number
Search Result: 25 Hits

Number Name Trans. Type End Date Bid Status
7000001068 | Sample Name Change RFQ 2011.05.20 15:00:00 | Mo Bid Created
7000001067 email cp teat RFQ 2011.05.22 00:00:00 Mo Bid Created
7000001088 AS_Test2011.05.19 11:11:18 RFQ 2011.05.31 00:00:00 Bid 2ubmitted
7000001055 AS_Email Teat 2011.05.19 08:41:07 RFQ 2011.05.31 00:00:00 Held
7000001054 Henry Test email 2011.05.18 17:15:48 RFQ 2011.05.21 00:00:00 Mo Bid Created g, 4 g[
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» Process Bid

|C.hec:k||F'.efresh||U|:|Iua|:|||=2=u:;:u: Previey

RFC: Name E0S5378 2011.01.24 13:12:16 Number 7000000500

T

Basic Data|| Information from Purchaser | My Motes | Partnern/Delivery Address

Check the information in your bid. %ou can alzo add your own notes.

Bid Number &000000268

Time Zone EST

End Date 24.01.2011 16:00:00
Bid Status Held

Incoterm / Lecation |[FOB ok |PLANT

Termz of Payment 30 Days Net | w

Currency CAD Canadian Dollar
Created on 24.01.2011 13:20:41 by Mr. doo waah

* The Bid Invitation can also be
deleted by clicking on the button
In the mode from within the Bid
itself

« If a bid is held, you must click on

the |[Changs| button so that you
can hit the |Dslst= | button

* Once deleted, a window will pop

up confirming the deletion

' E Bid 45_E0S375 2011,01.07 10:19:09 delsted
[
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Status Implications on h dro@
Submitting Bids Y one

* |f a Bid is in Held status and the Bid Invitation End Date is reached no
Bid is submitted.

* While making a change to a previously submitted Bid and if the Bid
Invitation End Date is reached the previously submitted bid is still
valid.

* Changing a Bid and Submitting overwrites the previously submitted
Bid.

« |f a previously submitted Bid is changed and in Held status no Bid is
submitted. The act of changing and Holding a previously Submitted bid
WITHDRAWS the last submitted Bid.
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